Regular Meeting
Wednesday, March 25, 2026

The regular meeting of the Board of County Road Commissioners of Newaygo County was called to order by Chairman Gonyon at 8:00 a.m. on
Wednesday, March 25, 2026, at the road commission offices.

Commissioners present: William Gonyon, Douglas Harmon, and Lee Fetterley
Staff present: Derek Wawsczyk, Manager and Kerry Hewitt, Clerk
Others present: Brian Sharp, A Sharper Service; Stu Sanders; and Rich Wheater.

Motion by Commissioner Fetterley and supported by Commissioner Harmon to approve the minutes of the regular meeting for March 11, 2026. All ayes.
Motion carried.

Motion by Commissioner Harmon and supported by Commissioner Fetterley to approve the following vendor checks, ach vendor payments, and payroll
checks:

March 27, 2026:
Vendor checks # 66582 - # 66599 and ACH Vendor checks elect. # 15211 - # 15245 in the amount of $185,407.27 and Payroll checks # 60506 - # 60519 in
the amount of $135,644.72 All ayes. Motion carried.

Public Comment: none

Award Bid: Asphalt Paving in various locations
Motion was made by Commissioner Harmon and supported by Commissioner Fetterley to accept management's recommendation and award asphalt paving
bid to low bid per township/location, Michigan Paving and Materials and Rieth-Riley Construction Co., Inc. All ayes. Motion carried.

Award Bid: Patch Material
After discussion, motion was made by Commissioner Fetterley and supported by Commissioner Harmon, to accept management's recommendation and
award CP7 patch material to Ace-Saginaw Paving Co. All ayes. Motion carried.

Award Bid: Culvert Material

Motion was made by Commissioner Harmon and supported by Commissioner Fetterley to accept management's recommendation and award CMP Culvert
Material to Cadillac Culvert, Plastic Culvert Material to ADS, and Timber Bridge Material to Krenn Timber Bridge; based on price, availability, project
schedules, and in the best interest of the Newaygo County Road Commission. All ayes. Motion carried.

Bid Opening: 2NS Ice Control Sand
18,000 White Cloud Facility

COMPANY COST PER TON TOTAL COST
Alpine Contracting, Inc. $ 6.50 $117,000.00
Barber Creek Sand & Gravel $ 7.50 $135,000.00
Dan's Excavating Service, Inc. $ 8.55 $153,900.00
L&D Carey & Sons Trucking $ 9.03 $162,540.00
Beckman Brothers $ 9.75 $175,500.00
A Sharper Service ** $ 10.83 $195,023.08

** cost per ton includes one month stacker rental

Marjo Construction $ 12.54 $225,720.00
Thunder Transport LLC $ 10.75 $193,500.00
Verplank Trucking $ 23.00 $414,000.00
Yellow Rose Transport no bid

3,000 Newaygo Facility

COMPANY COST PER TON TOTAL COST
Alpine Contracting, Inc. $ 8.50 $25,500.00
Barber Creek Sand & Gravel $ 9.30 $27,900.00
Dan's Excavating Service, Inc. $ 9.79 $29,370.00
L&D Carey & Sons Trucking $ 11.88 $35,640.00
Marjo Construction $ 14.87 $44,610.00
A Sharper Service ** $ 12.57 $37,709.34

** cost per ton includes one month stacker rental

Thunder Transport LLC $ 10.75 $32,250.00
Verplank Trucking $ 23.00 $69,000.00

Yellow Rose Transport no bid



Bids will be reviewed and awarded at a later date.

Bid Opening: Street Sweeping

1ST SWEEP 2ND SWEEP (IF APPROVED)
UNIT BID TOTAL COST UNIT BID TOTAL COST
PRICE PER FOR 10.37 PRICE PER FOR 10.37
BIDDER MILE MILES MILE MILES
SCA of MILLC $500.00 $5,185.00 $500.00 $5,185.00
Sanisweep, Inc. $800.00 $8,296.00 $800.00 $8,296.00
Tri-Us Services, Inc. $1,110.00 $11,510.70 $800.00 $8,296.00
additional 4.78 miles $1,110.00 $5,305.80 $800.00 $3,824.00
2nd sweep
1st sweep total $16,816.50 total $12,120.00
Tri-Us Services, Inc. for Newaygo County street sweeping: $225/hour

Note: Newaygo County Road Commission to provide dump site
Bids will be reviewed and awarded at a later date.

Bid Opening: 22A/23A Gravel supplied and delivered by township

ALPINE CONTRACTING L&D CAREY & SONS TRUCKING

22A 23A 22A 23A
Township price per ton price per ton Township price per ton price per ton
Ashland $ 1446 ton $ 1446 ton Ashland $ 1480 ton  $ 14.80
Barton $ 1533 ton $ 15.33  ton Barton $ 1515 ton  $ 15.15
Beaver $ 1533 ton $ 15.33  ton Beaver $ 1850 ton  $ 18.50
Big Prairie $ 13.00 ton $ 13.00 fon Big Prairie  $ 17.33 ton  $ 17.33
Bridgeton $ 1465 ton § 14.65 ton Bridgeton $ 16.40 ton  $ 16.40
Brooks $ 1388 ton $ 13.88  ton Brooks $ 1785 ton  $ 17.85
Croton $ 1450 ton $ 14.50  ton Croton $ 16.83 ton  $ 16.83
Dayton $ 15.00 ton $ 15.00 fon Dayton $ 17.02 ton  $ 17.02
Denver $ 1450 ton $ 14.50 ton Denver $ 18.05 ton  $ 18.05
Ensley $ 1495 ton $ 14.95 ton Ensley $ 16.20 ton  $ 16.20
Everett $ 13.00 ton $ 13.00 fon Everett $ 16.25 ton  $ 16.25
Garfield $ 14.00 ton _$ 14.00  ton Garfield $ 16.20 ton  § 16.20
Goodwell $ 1325 ton $ 13.25 ton Goodwell $ 1648 ton  $ 16.48
Grant $ 1450 ton $ 14.50  ton Grant $ 16.20 ton  $ 16.20
Home $ 15.00 ton $ 15.00 ton Home $ 1665 ton  $ 16.65
Lilley $ 1475 ton $ 14.75  ton Lilley $ 16.78 ton $ 16.78
Lincoln $ 1425 ton $ 14.25  ton Lincoln $ 18.34 ton  $ 18.34
Merrill $ 1450 ton $ 14.50 ton Merrill $ 1746 ton  $ 17.46
Monroe $ 1450 ton $ 14.50 ton Monroe $ 17.00 ton  $ 17.00
Norwich $ 1465 ton $ 14.65 ton Norwich $ 1728 ton  $ 17.28
Sheridan $ 1533 ton _$ 15.33  fon Sheridan $ 1768 ton  $ 17.68
Sherman $ 1325 ton _$ 13.25 ton Sherman $ 17.05 ton  $ 17.05
Troy $ 15.33 ton § 15.33  ton Troy $ 18.30 ton  $ 18.30
Wilcox $ 1325 ton $ 13.25 ton Wilcox $ 17.00 ton  $ 17.00

BECKMAN BROS, INC. DAN'S EXCAVATING SERVICE, INC.

22A 23A 22A 23A
Township price per ton price per ton Township price per ton price per ton
Ashland no bid ton no bid ton Ashland $ 1750 ton § 17.50
Barton ton no bid ton Barton $ 1950 ton  $ 19.50
Beaver ton no bid ton Beaver $ 20.00 ton $ 20.00
Big Prairie ton no bid ton Big Prairie _ § 17.00 ton  $ 17.00
Bridgeton ton $ 16.75 ton Bridgeton $ 16.50 ton  $ 16.50
Brooks ton no bid ton Brooks $ 1850 ton  $ 18.50
Croton ton no bid ton Croton $ 1740 ton  $ 17.40
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Dayton ton $ 15.75

Denver ton $ 15.75
Ensley ton no bid
Everett ton no bid
Garfield ton $ 16.50
Goodwell ton no bid
Grant ton no bid
Home ton no bid
Lilley ton no bid
Lincoln ton § 15.25
Merrill ton $ 16.00
Monroe ton no bid
Norwich ton no bid
Sheridan ton $ 17.00
Sherman ton $ 15.75
Troy ton $ 16.25
Wilcox ton no bid
YELLOW ROSE TRANSPORT

22A 23A
Township price per ton price per ton
Ashland $ 19.00 ton $ 19.00
Barton $ 2350 ton $ 23.50
Beaver $ 2350 ton $ 23.50
Big Prairie $ 2175 ton _§ 21.75
Bridgeton $ 2125 ton _$ 21.25
Brooks $ 2125 ton § 21.25
Croton $ 20.25 ton $ 20.25
Dayton $ 2225 ton $ 22.25
Denver $ 2275 ton § 22.75
Ensley $ 19.00 ton $ 19.00
Everett $ 2125 ton § 21.25
Garfield $ 2025 ton $ 20.25
Goodwell $ 2250 ton $ 22.50
Grant $ 19.25 ton _$ 19.25
Home $ 2375 ton § 23.75
Lilley $ 2350 ton _$ 23.50
Lincoln $ 2250 ton $ 22.50
Merrill $ 2275 ton § 22.75
Monroe $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00
Norwich $ 2375 ton § 23.75
Sheridan $ 2125 ton § 21.25
Sherman $ 2125 ton § 21.25
Troy $ 2575 ton $ 25.75
Wilcox $ 2250 ton $ 22.50

VERPLANK TRUCKING

22A 23A
Township price per ton price per ton
Ashland $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00
Barton $ 25.00 ton $ 25.00

Beaver $ 2450 ton $ 24.50
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Dayton $ 16.50 ton  $ 16.50
Denver $ 2325 ton $ 23.25
Ensley $ 1790 ton  $ 17.90
Everett $ 20.00 ton $ 20.00
Garfield $ 16.50 ton $ 16.50
Goodwell $ 2150 ton $ 21.50
Grant $ 17.00 ton  $ 17.00
Home $ 20.00 ton § 20.00
Lilley $ 2325 ton _$ 23.25
Lincoln $ 20.00 ton % 20.00
Merrill $ 22.00 ton % 22.00
Monroe $ 23.00 ton % 23.00
Norwich $ 1865 ton  $ 18.65
Sheridan $ 19.00 ton  $ 19.00
Sherman $ 17.00 ton  $ 17.00
Troy $ 20.00 ton $ 20.00
Wilcox $ 19.50 fton $ 19.50

MARJO CONSTRUCTION SERVICES, INC

22A 23A
Township price per ton price per ton
Ashland $ 21.03 ton $ 21.03

Barton 21.91 ton 21.91

Beaver 22.94 ton 22.94

Big Prairie 17.05 ton 17.05

Bridgeton 2212 ton 2212

Brooks 20.75 ton 20.75

Croton 18.69 ton 18.69

Dayton 21.02  ton 21.02

Denver 21.71 ton 21.71

Ensley 20.20 ton 20.20

Everett 18.29 ton 18.29

Garfield 21.30 ton 21.30

Grant 19.38 ton 19.38

Home 21.84 ton 21.84

Lilley 22.73 ton 22.73

Lincoln 20.48 ton 20.48

Merrill 20.68 ton 20.68

Monroe 20.20 ton 20.20

Norwich 20.06 ton 20.06

Sheridan 21.30 ton 21.30

Sherman 19.38 ton 19.38

Troy 22.94 ton 22.94

Wilcox 18.56  ton 18.56

$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
Goodwell $ 1842 ton _ $ 18.42
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $
$ $

RIETH-RILEY CONSTRUCTION CO INC.
22A 23A
Township price per ton price per ton

Ashland $ 24.00 ton $ 24.00

Barton $ 17.00 ton $ 17.00

Beaver $ 1925 ton $ 19.25
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Big Prairie $ 2350 ton $ 23.50 ton Big Prairie _ § 2250 ton % 2250 ton
Bridgeton $ 2250 ton $ 22.50 ton Bridgeton $ 25.00 fon $ 25.00 fon
Brooks $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00 ton Brooks $ 23.50 ton $ 23.50 ton
Croton $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00 ton Croton $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00 ton
Dayton $ 2350 ton $ 23.50 ton Dayton $ 2350 fton $ 23.50 ton
Denver $ 24.00 ton $ 24.00 ton Denver $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00 ton
Ensley $ 2250 ton $ 22.50 ton Ensley $ 2350 fton $ 23.50 ton
Everett $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00 fon Everett $ 23.00 ton % 23.00 ton
Garfield $ 23.00 ton $ 23.00 fon Garfield $ 24.00 ton % 24.00 ton
Goodwell $ 24.00 ton $ 24.00 ton Goodwell $ 2150 ton % 21.50 ton
Grant $ 2250 ton $ 2250 ton Grant $ 24.00 ton % 24.00 ton
Home $ 25.00 ton $ 25.00 fon Home $ 1750 ton  $ 17.50 ton
Lilley $ 25.00 ton $ 25.00 ton Lilley $ 18.00 fton $ 18.00 ton
Lincoln $ 2450 ton $ 24.50 ton Lincoln $ 22.00 ton $ 22.00 ton
Merrill $ 24.00 ton $ 24.00 ton Merrill $ 19.00 ton  $ 19.00 ton
Monroe $ 2450 ton $ 24.50 ton Monroe $ 18.75 ton  $ 18.75 ton
Norwich $ 2450 ton $ 24.50 ton Norwich $ 1850 ton  $ 18.50 ton
Sheridan $ 2250 ton $ 22.50 ton Sheridan $ 2450 ton $ 24.50 ton
Sherman $ 2250 ton $ 2250 ton Sherman $ 2325 ton $ 23.25 ton
Troy $ 2450 ton $ 24.50 ton Troy $ 1850 ton § 18.50 ton
Wilcox $ 2350 ton $ 23.50 ton Wilcox $ 2175 ton _$ 21.75 ton

Motion was made by Commissioner Harmon and supported by Commissioner Fetterley to accept management's recommendation and award the bid to the 4
lowest bidders. When material is needed we will start with low bid per township, pending testing, delivery schedule, and in the best interest of the Newaygo
County Road Commission. All ayes. Motion carried.

Kerry presented the board with an updated cash flow and spreadsheets for township and primary projects.

Kerry presented the following contracts with Grant Township:

e 112" St. from the west township line east to Willow Ave. — Wedge and Overlay

e 112" St. from Willow Ave. to Walnut Ave. — Overlay

e  Walnut Ave. from 112" St. to 1,600 ft. north of 104™ St. — Wedge and Overlay
Motion by Commissioner Harmon and supported by Commissioner Fetterley to approve and sign the above-mentioned contracts with Grant Township. All
ayes. Motion carried.

Kerry informed the board that she voluntarily signed up for a MERS audit. They are making sure wages report are accurate and the DB Contributions
collected and reported match.

Derek reported that Kent County Road Commission held a bid letting for our chip seal emulsion on March 3, 2026. The following bid tabs were compiled
and presented:

Bid #26-MNT-10: Fog Seal Emulsion Materials

Bid Completion Date: December 31, 2026

Michigan Paving & Materials Co Bit-Mat Products
Kent County Newaygo Oceana Picked Up at | Kent County Newaygo Oceana Picked Up at
Product Road County Road | County Road | Supplier's Road County Road | County Road | Supplier's
Commission | Commission | Commission Plant Commission | Commission | Commission Plant
Fast Set $1.39 $1.39 $1.39 $1.21 $1.80 $1.87 $1.83 $1.78
Minimum Shipment
(Gallons) 9,000 Gallons 9,000 Gallons
FOB Alma, MI Bay City, MI
Lead Time 1 Day 4 Hours
Free Unload Time 4 Hours 4 Hours
Demurrage Rate $110 Per Hour $135 Per Hour
Cancel Load Time 4 Hours : 6 Hours
Return Load Terms 1.5x Freight, Not to Exeed $400 1.5x Outbound, Min $200
Firm Price Date 12/31/2026 03/03/2027

Bid Letting Date: 03/03/2026



Bid #26-MNT-09: Chip Seal Emulsion Materials

Bid Completion Date: December 31, 2026

Michigan Paving & Materials Co. Bit-Mat Products
Kent County Newaygo Oceana Picked Up at | Kent County Newaygo Oceana Picked Up at
Product Road County Road | County Road Supplier's Road County Road | County Road Supplier's
Commission | Commission | Commission Plant Commission | Commission | Commission Plant
HFRS-2M - - - - $2.071 $2.361 $2.191 $2.05
CRS-2M $2.17 $2.17 $2.17 $2.00 $2.071 $2.361 $2.191 $2.05
MmO Bhipmen 9,000 Gallons 9000 Gallons
(Gallons)
FOB Alma, MI Bay City, MI
Lead Time 1 Day 4 Hours
Free Unload Time 4 Hours 4 Hours
Demurrage Rate $110 Per Hour $135 Per Hour
Cancel Load Time 4 Hours 6 Hours
Return Load Terms 1.5x Freight, Min $350, Not to Exceed of $400 1.5x Freight, Min. $200
Firm Price Date 12/31/2026 03/03/2027
Bid Letting Date: 03/03/2026
Bid Tabulation
Bid #26-MNT-11: Spray Patch Mix Emulsion Materials
e B Bid Completion Date: December 31, 2026
|
Product Michigan Paving & Materials Co Bit-Mat Products
— - I
Picked Up At $1.90 ' $2.00
Supplier's Location
Cost Per Gallon AMS SP | AE-80
2001 Butterworth St SW $2.72 ' €3 12
(City of GR)
Cost Per Gallon AMS SP AE-90 i
935 One Mile (NCRC) $2.72 $3.12
Cost Per Gallen AMS SP AE-90
N AL St 1,500 Gallons 1,000 Gallons
|{Gallons)
FOB Alma, MI Bay City, Ml
Lead Time 1 Day 4 Hours
Firm Price Date 12/31/2026 03/03/2027

Bid Letting Date: 03/03/2026

Motion by Commissioner Fetterley and supported by Commissioner Harmon to accept management’s recommendation and award Fog Seal Emulsion, Chip
Seal Emulsion, and Spray Patch Mix Emulsion to low bid, Michigan Paving & Materials Co. All ayes. Motion carried.

Derek informed the board that we plan to lift weight restrictions on Monday, March 30", along with the other surrounding road commissions.

Derek updated the board on the urban fund project scheduled for 2026 of Lake Dr. from Connie to the east. Derek reported on the cost share discussions he
had with Todd Blake, City of Fremont Manager.

Derek reported that he and Mike attended a virtual GI meeting on Thursday with MDOT for the 2026 fed aid chip seal project. The project should be on
track for a June or July bid letting.

Derek informed the board that he has a meeting today at 1 p.m. with Consumers Energy to finalize the realignment of Beech Ave. north of 16th St. project.

Derek reported on the lowering of the load limits on the bridge over the White River on 3 Mile Rd. east of M-37. MDOT randomly inspected five bridges
and lowered the limits to 3 tons at this specific location. Derek informed the board that he has heard some concerns about the new limit.

Derek informed the board that we plan to end second shift on Friday, March 26™.
Derek reported on the package of information he received from the Rural Road Alliance. Commissioner Harmon received it as well.

Public Comment: Stu Sanders congratulated Commissioner Gonyon on his retirement and thanked the board for all that we do, especially in northern
Lincoln township.

Commissioner discussion items:
Commissioner Fetterley thanked Commissioner Gonyon for his years of service.



Commissioner Harmon thanked Commissioner Gonyon for being a great mentor and mentioned his history and knowledge will be missed.
Commissioner Harmon reported that he attended the last County Commission meeting and gave them a brief update. Commissioner Harmon mentioned
that he has been meeting with Asa regularly as the Parks are getting ready to open for the season.

Commissioner Gonyon stated that he has enjoyed his time serving the public and accomplishing the things that we do with the little resources and funding
that we receive.

With no objections, Chairman Gonyon adjourned the meeting at 8:50 a.m.

William Gonyon, Chairman Kerry Hewitt, Clerk
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